GRUNDY COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

TABULATION OF BIDS
Date: March 24, 2016

Time: 10:00 A.M. 0il & Chip Projects
16-XX000-00-GM
Awarded to:
Grundy County Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section # 16-00000-00-GM
ltems Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Material HFE-150 Gal 8,359 $2.35  $19,643.65 no bid - $2.47  $20,646.73
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13,150r 16) Ton 299 $28.50 $8,521.50 no bid - $38.00 $11,362.00
TOTAL $28,165.15 N/A $32,008.73 Steffens 3-D
Braceville Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section # 16-02000-00-GM
ltems Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Material HFE-150 Gal 9,810 $2.35  $23,053.50 no bid - $2.47  $24,230.70
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13,150r 16) Ton 350 $30.00 $10,500.00 no bid - $38.00 $13,300.00
TOTAL $33,553.50 N/A $37,530.70 Steffens 3-D
Felix Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section # 16-04000-00-GM
ltems Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Material HFE-150 Gal 1,811 $3.20 $5,795.20 no bid - $2.47 $4,473.17
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13,150r 16) Ton 65 $45.00 $2,925.00 no bid - $38.00 $2,470.00
TOTAL $8,720.20 N/A $6,943.17 AC Pavement
Garfield Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section 16-05000-00-GM
Items Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Material HFE-150 Gal 5,482 $2.45  $13,430.90 no bid - $2.47  $13,540.54
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13,150r 16) Ton 196 $30.00 $5,880.00 no bid - $38.00 $7,448.00
TOTAL $19,310.90 N/A $20,988.54 Steffens 3-D




GRUNDY COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

TABULATION OF BIDS
Date: March 24, 2016

Time: 10:00 A.M. 0il & Chip Projects
16-XX000-00-GM
Awarded to:
Goodfarm Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section 16-06000-00-GM
ltems Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Materials HFE-150 Gal 13,254 $2.25  $29,821.50 no bid - $2.47 $32,737.38
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13 0or CA15) Ton 473 $28.00 $13,244.00 no bid - $38.00 $17,974.00
TOTAL $43,065.50 N/A $50,711.38 Steffens 3-D
Greenfield Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section 16-08000-00-GM
ltems Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Materials HFE-150 Gal 2,071 $2.75 $5,695.25 no bid - $2.47 $5,115.37
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13,150r 16) Ton 74 $30.00 $2,220.00 no bid - $38.00 $2,812.00
TOTAL $7,915.25 N/A $7,927.37 Steffens 3-D
Mazon Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section 16-11000-00-GM
ltems Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Preparation of Base Sqvyd 11,437 $1.00  $11,437.00 no bid - $0.87 $9,950.19
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gal 4,003 $2.00 $8,006.00 no bid - $1.70 $6,805.10
Bituminous Material HFE-150 Gal 8,349 $2.40  $20,037.60 no bid - $2.47  $20,622.03
Cover Coat Aggregate Ton 142 $36.00 $5,112.00 no bid - $38.00 $5,396.00
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13 or 15) Ton 126 $32.00 $4,032.00 no bid - $41.00 $5,166.00
TOTAL $48,624.60 N/A $47,939.32 AC Pavement




GRUNDY COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

TABULATION OF BIDS
Date: March 24, 2016

Time: 10:00 A.M. 0il & Chip Projects
16-XX000-00-GM
Awarded to:
Nettle Creek Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section 16-13000-00-GM
ltems Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Materials HFE-150 Gal 29,848 $2.10 $62,680.80 no bid - $2.47 $73,724.56
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13 or 15) Ton 1,066 $28.00 $29,848.00 no bid - $38.00  $40,508.00
Fog Seal Sqyd 72,398 $0.40 $28,959.20 no bid - $0.46  $33,303.08
TOTAL $121,488.00 N/A $147,535.64 Steffens 3-D
Norman Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section 16-14000-00-GM
Items Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Materials HFE-150 Gal 8,047 $2.35  $18,910.45 no bid - $2.47  $19,876.09
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13 or 15) Ton 287 $28.00 $8,036.00 no bid - $38.00  $10,906.00
Fog Seal Sqgyd 22,990 $0.40 $9,196.00 no bid - $0.52  $11,954.80
TOTAL $36,142.45 N/A $42,736.89 Steffens 3-D
Saratoga Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section 16-15000-00-GM
ltems Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Bit Materials HFE-150 Gal 8,394 $2.48 $20,817.12 no bid - $2.47  $20,733.18
Seal Coat Agg (CA 16) Ton 300 $30.00 $9,000.00 no bid - $38.00 $11,400.00
TOTAL $29,817.12 N/A $32,133.18 Steffens 3-D
Veinna Township Steffens 3-D Beniach AC Pavement
Section 16-16000-00-GM
Items Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Preparation of Base Sqvyd 17,595 $1.00 $17,595.00 no bid - $0.87 $15,307.65
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gal 6,158 $2.00 $12,316.00 no bid - $1.70 $10,468.60
Bit Material HFE-150 Gal 12,844 $2.20  $28,256.80 no bid - $2.47 $31,724.68
Cover Coat Aggregate Ton 220 $36.00 $7,920.00 no bid - $38.00 $8,360.00
Seal Coat Agg (CA 13 or 15) Ton 194 $33.00 $6,402.00 no bid - $41.00 $7,954.00
TOTAL $72,489.80 N/A $73,814.93 Steffens 3-D






