ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATIO

TABULATION OF BIDS

County - Grundy

Date: November 17, 2016

Time: 10:00 A.M.

Grundy County Sign Program

Section 15-00000-00-SG Lightle Enterprises Shoop & Sons Warning Lites Narvick Brothers Hy Viz Newman Signs Midwest Signworks Highway Safety Corp MD Signs*

Item Unit |Quantity| Unit Price| Total |[Unit Price| Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Group 1

Sign Panel - Type 1 SqFt| 55825 $4.71| $26,293.58|No Bid #VALUE! $4.77| $26,628.53|No Bid #VALUE! [No Bid #VALUE! $3.13| $17,491.25|No Bid #VALUE! $7.00[ $39,077.50 $4.40| $24,563.00

Sign Panel - Type 2 Sq Ft 20 $5.06 $101.20|No Bid #VALUE! $5.40 $108.00|No Bid #VALUE! [No Bid #VALUE! $258.46| $5,169.10(No Bid #VALUE! $7.00 $140.00 $5.25 $105.00

Group 1 Total $26,394.78 #VALUE! $26,736.53 #VALUE! #VALUE! $22,660.35 #VALUE! $39,217.50 $24,668.00

Group 2 Total

Metal Post - Type B (U Channel) Foot 5448 $2.58| $14,055.84|No Bid #VALUE! $2.19| $11,931.12(No Bid #VALUE! [No Bid #VALUE! $2.21| $12,046.00(No Bid #VALUE! $5.00 $27,240.00 $2.28 | $12,421.44

Metal Post - Type B (Square) Foot 2430 $2.59| $6,293.70|No Bid #VALUE! $2.49|  $6,050.70|No Bid #VALUE! [No Bid #VALUE! $3.13| $7,611.25|No Bid #VALUE! $5.00] $12,150.00 $2.06| $5,005.80

Steel Square Anchors Each 221 $27.08| $5,984.68|No Bid #VALUE! $22.30| $4,928.30|No Bid #VALUE! [No Bid #VALUE! $26.87| $5,937.75|No Bid #VALUE! $29.00|  $6,409.00 $8.28| $1,829.88

Group 2 Total $26,334.22 #VALUE! $22,910.12 #VALUE! #VALUE! $25,595.00 #VALUE! $45,799.00 $19,257.12

Group 3

Wood Sign Support Foot 4396 $1.01| $4,439.96|No Bid #VALUE! $1.32| $5,802.72|No Bid #VALUE! [No Bid #VALUE! [No Bid #VALUE! [No Bid #VALUE! $3.00| $13,188.00 $1.03| $4,527.88

Group 3 Total $4,439.96 #VALUE! $5,802.72 #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! $13,188.00 $4,527.88

Grand Total $57,168.96 #VALUE! $55,449.37 #VALUE! | | #vALUE! | | $48,255.35 | | #vALUE! | | $98,204.50] $48,453.00
o T T \ * Note that MD Solutions Steel Square Anchors did not meet the specifications and thus their Group 2 bid is rejected.
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