ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

TABULATION OF BIDS

County - Grundy

Location: Grundy County Highway Depal

rtment

Date: May 18, 2017

Time: 10:00 A..M.

Grundy County - Crack Filling AC Pavement Striping SKC Denler Microsurfacing
Section 17-00165-00-PP Unit | Quantity |Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Crack Filling (Fiber Asphalt) Pound | 20,000 No Bid #VALUE! $1.47 $29,400.00 $1.16 $23,200.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Traf Cont-Prot 701306 L.Sum 1 No Bid #VALUE! $100.00 $100.00 | $1,000.00 | $1,000.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Total #VALUE! $29,500.00 $24,200.00 #VALUE!
Grundy County - Cape Seal AC Pavement Striping Microsurfacing

Section 17-00166-00-PP Unit | Quantity |Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

Bituminous Materials HFE-90 Gal. 51,225 $2.16 | $110,646.00 $2.35 $120,378.75

Seal Coat Aggregate (CA-16) Ton 1,829 $34.00 | $62,186.00 $32.75 $59,899.75

Traf Cont-Prot 701306 L.Sum 1 $1,800.00 | $1,800.00 |$27,000.00| $27,000.00

Mod Ureth Pm Ltr-Sym Sq.Ft. 242 $3.95 $955.90 $4.50 $1,089.00

Mod Ureth Pm Line 4 Foot 132,330 $0.46 $60,871.80 $0.31 $41,022.30

Mod Ureth Pm Line 8 Foot 970 $0.90 $873.00 $0.75 $727.50

Mod Ureth Pm Line 12 Foot 280 $1.50 $420.00 $2.25 $630.00

Mod Ureth Pm Line 24 Foot 209 $4.25 $888.25 $4.50 $940.50

Raised Ref Pvt Mk Rem (Spec| Each 600 $12.00 $7,200.00 $10.00 $6,000.00

Micro-Surf Single Pass Type Il| Sq.Yd. | 146,308 $2.27 | $332,119.16 $2.56 $374,548.48

Total $577,960.11 $632,236.28




