
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TABULATION OF BIDS
County - Grundy
Location: Grundy County Highway Department
Date:  May 18, 2017
Time:  10:00 A..M.

Grundy County - FDR
Section 17-00167-00-PV Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
FDR - Base Stabilization 12" Sq.Yd. 9,771 No Bid #VALUE! $5.20 $50,809.20 No Bid #VALUE! $4.90 $47,877.90
Cement Ton 357 No Bid #VALUE! $128.92 $46,024.44 No Bid #VALUE! $104.00 $37,128.00
Surface Profile Milling Sq.Yd. 9,771 No Bid #VALUE! $1.85 $18,076.35 No Bid #VALUE! $2.75 $26,870.25
Bituminous Materials (Prime) Gal. 3,812 No Bid #VALUE! $1.62 $6,175.44 No Bid #VALUE! $1.61 $6,137.32
Bituminous Materials HFE-150 Gal. 7,951 No Bid #VALUE! $3.56 $28,305.56 No Bid #VALUE! $3.55 $28,226.05
Cover Coat Aggrgate Ton 136 No Bid #VALUE! $49.22 $6,693.92 No Bid #VALUE! $49.50 $6,732.00
Seal Coat Aggregate Ton 120 No Bid #VALUE! $47.22 $5,666.40 No Bid #VALUE! $47.30 $5,676.00
Traf Control & Prot Special L.Sum 1 No Bid #VALUE! $3,500.00 $3,500.00 No Bid #VALUE! $9,250.00 $9,250.00
Total #VALUE! $165,251.31 #VALUE! $167,897.52

Rock SolidD Construction Terra-Firma Dunn


