
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TABULATION OF BIDS
County - Grundy
Location: Grundy County Highway Department
Date:  May 18, 2017
Time:  10:00 A..M.

Vienna Twp. Railroad Crossing
Section 15-16126-00-SP Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Earth Excavation Cu Yd 478 $20.92 $9,999.76 $12.00 $5,736.00 $15.00 $7,170.00 No Bid #VALUE! $20.00 $9,560.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Furnished Excavation Cu Yd 3032 $23.25 $70,494.00 $18.00 $54,576.00 $14.00 $42,448.00 No Bid #VALUE! $26.00 $78,832.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Pipe Culvert Removal Feet 102 $35.00 $3,570.00 $10.00 $1,020.00 $10.00 $1,020.00 No Bid #VALUE! $13.00 $1,326.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Concrete Removal Cu Yd 1 $4,120.00 $4,120.00 $200.00 $200.00 $540.00 $540.00 No Bid #VALUE! $250.00 $250.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Temporary Ditch Check Feet 24 $100.00 $2,400.00 $10.00 $240.00 $20.00 $480.00 No Bid #VALUE! $25.00 $600.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Trench Back Fill Cu Yd 80 $50.00 $4,000.00 $50.00 $4,000.00 $27.30 $2,184.00 No Bid #VALUE! $21.50 $1,720.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Pipe Culvert, 6" PVC Schd 40 Feet 7 $198.00 $1,386.00 $30.00 $210.00 $29.00 $203.00 No Bid #VALUE! $20.00 $140.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Pipe Culvert, 8" PVC Schd 40 Feet 5 $376.00 $1,880.00 $32.00 $160.00 $46.00 $230.00 No Bid #VALUE! $20.00 $100.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Pipe Culvert, CL D, Type 1, 15" Feet 84 $41.30 $3,469.20 $45.00 $3,780.00 $22.00 $1,848.00 No Bid #VALUE! $26.00 $2,184.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Pipe Culvert, CL D, Type 1, 24" Feet 22 $115.00 $2,530.00 $55.00 $1,210.00 $35.00 $770.00 No Bid #VALUE! $36.00 $792.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Pipe Culvert, CL D, Type 2, 24" Feet 126 $65.50 $8,253.00 $60.00 $7,560.00 $43.00 $5,418.00 No Bid #VALUE! $47.50 $5,985.00 No Bid #VALUE!
End Sections, 15" Each 1 $1,924.00 $1,924.00 $350.00 $350.00 $200.00 $200.00 No Bid #VALUE! $155.00 $155.00 No Bid #VALUE!
End Sections, 24" Each 5 $1,545.00 $7,725.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $230.00 $1,150.00 No Bid #VALUE! $165.00 $825.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Manhole Type A, 4' Dia, Type 1 Frame CL Each 1 $3,610.00 $3,610.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,860.00 $1,860.00 No Bid #VALUE! $1,475.00 $1,475.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Manhole Type A, 5' Dia, Type 1 Frame CL Each 1 $4,310.00 $4,310.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,290.00 $2,290.00 No Bid #VALUE! $1,675.00 $1,675.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Aggregate Base Type B Tons 552 $34.95 $19,292.40 $20.00 $11,040.00 $20.00 $11,040.00 No Bid #VALUE! $13.00 $7,176.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Seeding, CL 2 (Special) Acre 0.4 $16,250.00 $6,500.00 $4,000.00 $1,600.00 $8,000.00 $3,200.00 No Bid #VALUE! $10,000.00 $4,000.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Railroad Protective Liability Insurance L Sum 1 $10,033.28 $10,033.28 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 No Bid #VALUE! $4,500.00 $4,500.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Traffic Control and Protection (Special) L Sum 1 $5,000.40 $5,000.40 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 No Bid #VALUE! $1,000.00 $1,000.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Concrete Collar (Special) Each 2 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $400.00 $800.00 No Bid #VALUE! $500.00 $1,000.00 No Bid #VALUE!

Total $172,897.04 $107,682.00 $88,851.00 #VALUE! $123,295.00 #VALUE!

Tobey'sQuakaStott D Construction Riber PT Ferro


