
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TABULATION OF BIDS
County - Grundy
Location: Grundy County Highway Department
Date:  July 20, 2017
Time:  10:00 A..M.

Grundy County - 2017 Striping
Section 2017 Striping Program Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Epoxy Pavement Marking Line 4" Foot 98,621 No Bid #VALUE! $0.55 $54,241.55 $0.55 $54,241.55 No Bid #VALUE! $0.50 $49,310.50
Epoxy Marking Line 24" Foot 156 No Bid #VALUE! $20.00 $3,120.00 $16.00 $2,496.00 No Bid #VALUE! $4.50 $702.00
Epoxy Pavement Marking Letters Sq Ft 372 No Bid #VALUE! $5.00 $1,860.00 $16.00 $5,952.00 No Bid #VALUE! $4.50 $1,674.00
Total #VALUE! $59,221.55 $62,689.55 #VALUE! $51,686.50

Precision Pavement Varsity StripingMarking Specialists CorpMaintenance Striping Roadsafe


