ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

TABULATION OF BIDS

County - Grundy

Location: Grundy County Highway De

partment

Date: July 20, 2017

Time: 10:00 A..M.

Erienna TWP - Stockdale Road D Construction PT Ferro
Section 17-02000-00-GM Unit Quantity | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
HMA Surf Rem Butt Jt Sq Yd 124 0.01 $1.24 No Bid #VALUE!
Bit Matls Pr Ct Pound 5,281 0.01 $52.81 No Bid #VALUE!
Agg Pr Ct Ton 23 0.01 $0.23 No Bid #VALUE!
Aggregate Shoulders, Type B Ton 434 25.00 $10,850.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Short-Term Pav Mk Special Foot 533 0.01 $5.33 No Bid #VALUE!
Epoxy Pvt Mk Line 4 Foot 4,154 1.37 $5,690.98 No Bid #VALUE!
Lev Bind MM N30 Ton 1,221 78.00 $95,238.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Total $111,838.59 #VALUE!




