
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TABULATION OF BIDS
County - Grundy
Location: Grundy County Highway Department
Date:  July 20, 2017
Time:  10:00 A..M.

Vienna Twp - Bennett Road Culverts
Section 17-16127-00-BR Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
142" X 91" CMP Pipe Arch Foot 140 $650.00 $91,000.00 $720.00 $100,800.00 $516.00 $72,240.00 No Bid #VALUE! $376.00 $52,640.00 No Bid #VALUE! $650.00 $91,000.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Earth Excavation Cu Yd 634 $25.00 $15,850.00 $35.00 $22,190.00 $18.00 $11,412.00 No Bid #VALUE! $12.00 $7,608.00 No Bid #VALUE! $45.00 $28,530.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Furnished Excavation Cu Yd 832 $25.00 $20,800.00 $45.00 $37,440.00 $25.00 $20,800.00 No Bid #VALUE! $16.00 $13,312.00 No Bid #VALUE! $58.00 $48,256.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Channel Excavation Cu Yd 75 $30.00 $2,250.00 $30.00 $2,250.00 $20.00 $1,500.00 No Bid #VALUE! $10.00 $750.00 No Bid #VALUE! $55.00 $4,125.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Rip Rap Class A4 Sq Yd 377 $60.00 $22,620.00 $75.00 $28,275.00 $61.00 $22,997.00 No Bid #VALUE! $43.00 $16,211.00 No Bid #VALUE! $85.00 $32,045.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Gabions Cu Yd 100 $350.00 $35,000.00 $300.00 $30,000.00 $255.00 $25,500.00 No Bid #VALUE! $295.00 $29,500.00 No Bid #VALUE! $70.00 $7,000.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Removal of Existing Superstructure Each 1 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 No Bid #VALUE! $500.00 $500.00 No Bid #VALUE! $12,500.00 $12,500.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Seeding Class 2 (Special) Acre 0.85 $4,000.00 $3,400.00 $4,800.00 $4,080.00 $5,000.00 $4,250.00 No Bid #VALUE! $5,000.00 $4,250.00 No Bid #VALUE! $45,584.00 $38,746.40 No Bid #VALUE!
Traffic Control and Protection (Special) Lsum 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $800.00 $800.00 No Bid #VALUE! $800.00 $800.00 No Bid #VALUE! $5,000.00 $5,000.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Total $208,420.00 $232,035.00 $164,499.00 #VALUE! $125,571.00 #VALUE! $267,202.40 #VALUE!
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