ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

TABULATION OF BIDS

County - Grundy

Location: Grundy County Highway Department

Date: November 22, 2017

Time: 10:00 A..M.

Vienna TWP - Waupecan Road Box Culvert Riber Construction Quaka Excavating D Construction Herlihy Mid-Continent IHC Construction Stott Contracting Conley Excavating
Section 17-16128-00-BR Unit Quantity = Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Porous Granular Embankment Cu Yd 123 $44.00 $5,412.00 $51.00 $6,273.00 $45.00 $5,535.00 No Bid #VALUE! $113.00  $13,899.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Seeding, Class 2A Acre 0 $8,520.00 $852.00  $10,000.00 $1,000.00 | $7,500.00 $750.00 No Bid #VALUE! $5,480.00 $548.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Nitrogen Fertilizer Nutrient Pound 8 $3.00 $24.00 $18.75 $150.00 $5.00 $40.00 No Bid #VALUE! $8.00 $64.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Phosphorous Fertilizer Nutrient Pound 8 $3.00 $24.00 $18.75 $150.00 $5.00 $40.00 No Bid #VALUE! $8.00 $64.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Potassium Fertilizer Nutrient Pound 8 $3.00 $24.00 $18.75 $150.00 $5.00 $40.00 No Bid #VALUE! $8.00 $64.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Mulch, Method 2 Acre 0 $0.10 $0.01 $15,000.00| $1,500.00  $5,000.00 $500.00 No Bid #VALUE! $8,890.00 $889.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Erosion Control Blanket Sq Yd 398 $2.00 $796.00 $6.28 $2,499.44 $2.50 $995.00 No Bid #VALUE! $3.00 $1,194.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Temporary Erosion Control Seeding Pound 59 $0.01 $0.59 $5.00 $295.00 $3.00 $177.00 No Bid #VALUE! $3.00 $177.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Perimeter Erosion Barrier Foot 20 $0.01 $0.20 $6.00 $120.00 $10.00 $200.00 No Bid #VALUE! $15.00 $300.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Stone Riprap, Class A4 Sq vYd 32 $80.00 $2,560.00 $70.00 $2,240.00 $92.00 $2,944.00 No Bid #VALUE! $275.00 $8,800.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Filter Fabric Sq Yd 32 $3.00 $96.00 10.00 $320.00 4.00 $128.00 No Bid #VALUE! $69.00 $2,208.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Aggregate Surface Course, Type B Ton 61 $36.00 $2,196.00 31.00 $1,891.00 35.00 $2,135.00 No Bid #VALUE! $118.00 $7,198.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Pipe Culvert Removal Foot 60 $12.00 $720.00 125.00 $7,500.00 30.00 $1,800.00 No Bid #VALUE! $140.00 $8,400.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Reinforcement Bars Pound 11,480 $1.35 $15,498.00 2.25 $25,830.00 0.65 $7,462.00 No Bid #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Concrete Box Culverts CuYd 52 $1,030.00 $53,560.00 1,055.00 $54,860.00 875.00 $45,500.00 No Bid #VALUE! $1,687.00 $87,724.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Traffic Control and Protection, (Specia L Sum 1 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 800.00 $800.00 2,354.00 $2,354.00 No Bid #VALUE! $4,836.00 $4,836.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Construction Layout L Sum 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 1,000.00 $1,000.00 2,400.00 $2,400.00 No Bid #VALUE! $3,625.00  $3,625.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Total $87,662.80 $106,578.44 $73,000.00 #VALUE! $139,990.00 #VALUE! #VALUE!




