
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
TABULATION OF BIDS
County - Grundy
Location: Grundy County Highway Department
Date:  July 19, 2018
Time:  10:00 A..M.
Group 4

2018 Grundy County Striping
2018 Striping Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Mod Ureth Pm Line 4 Foot 69141 $0.65 $44,941.65 $0.95 $65,683.95 $0.93 $64,301.13 No Bid #VALUE!
Mod Ureth Pm Line 24 Foot 231 $6.00 $1,386.00 $10.00 $2,310.00 $10.00 $2,310.00 No Bid #VALUE!
Mod Ureth Pm Line Ltr- Sym Sq. Ft 553 $6.50 $3,594.50 $10.00 $5,530.00 $5.75 $3,179.75 No Bid #VALUE!
Thermoplastic Pm Line 4 Foot 15,957 $0.78 $12,446.46 $1.00 $15,957.00 $0.83 $13,244.31 No Bid #VALUE!
Exisiting paint removal Foot 8,335 $0.68 $5,667.80 $1.25 $10,418.75 $0.55 $4,584.25 No Bid #VALUE!
Total $68,036.41 $99,899.70 $87,619.44 #VALUE!

2018 Striping Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Mod Ureth Pm Line 4 Foot 69141 $0.38 $26,273.58 $0.63 $43,558.83
Mod Ureth Pm Line 24 Foot 231 $5.00 $1,155.00 $5.00 $1,155.00
Mod Ureth Pm Line Ltr- Sym Sq. Ft 553 $5.00 $2,765.00 $5.00 $2,765.00
Thermoplastic Pm Line 4 Foot 15,957 $0.60 $9,574.20 $0.68 $10,850.76
Exisiting paint removal Foot 8,335 $0.90 $7,501.50 $0.48 $4,000.80
Total $47,269.28 $62,330.39

Varsity Striping

Traffic Control Company

AC Pavement Road Safe Marking Specialist

Maintenance Coatings


